
ONTARIO COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

BID PRICE TABULATION SHEET

BID NAME AND NUMBER B23009 Manhole Rehabilitation Services

OPENING TIME 11:00 a.m.

OPENING DATE

VENDOR National Water Advanced

Main Cleaning Rehabilitation

Co. Technology

ITEM DESCRIPTION UOM

1 Mobilization  LS $2,500.00 $3,500.00

2 Chemical Grouting of Manholes EA $150.00 $1,600.00

3 Chemical Grout GAL $75.00 $170.00

4 Cementitious Restoration of Manholes VLF $250.00 No bid

5 Manhole Rehabilitation with Polymer Systems VLF $500.00 $285.00

6 Polymer Chimney Seals EA $650.00 $900.00

7 Channel Rebuild EA $750.00 $1,400.00

8 Replace Manhole Frame and Cover EA $2,000.00 No bid

9 Manhole Adjustment Materials, Up to 1 Vertical Foot EA $700.00 No bid

10 Manhole Adjustment Materials, Over 1 Vertical Foot VLF $700.00 No bid

11 Bituminous Pavement Restoration for Items 8, 9, & 10 SF $100.00 No bid

12 Manhole Steps EA $75.00 $85.00

November 29, 2022

Rusty
Typewriter
+ 3.7%   $295.54

Rusty
Typewriter
+3.7%   $3,629.50

Rusty
Typewriter
+3.7%   $1,451.80

Rusty
Typewriter
+3.7%  $88.15

Rusty
Typewriter
+3.7%  $176.29


